

**2013 TAX SALE**

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-014-0016 \	\$ 4,772.53		
01-014-0017 /	\$ 2,133.39	\$ 24,000.00	
01-065-0046	\$ 7,414.97	\$ 12,500.00	
02-022-0044	\$ 3,567.80	\$ 5,500.00	
02-052-0040	\$ 395.55	\$ 395.55	
02-057-0020	\$ 7,324.71	\$ 63,000.00	
02-057-0021	\$ 6,961.58	\$ 76,000.00	
04-042-0009	\$ 1,460.35	\$ 1,460.35	
04-044-0017	\$ 2,415.47	No Bid	Struck Off to County
04-051-0001	\$ 11,664.70	No Bid	Struck Off to County
04-061-0043	\$ 4,549.80	\$ 20,000.00	
05-117-0043	\$ 3,059.23	No Bid	Struck Off to County
05-130-0050	\$ 178.12	\$ 178.12	
05-149-0006	\$ 1,440.97	No Bid	Struck Off to County
06-055-0029	\$ 166.97	\$ 166.97	
07-083-0046	\$ 2,652.50	No Bid	
07-633-0016	\$ 181.33	\$ 181.33	
08-047-0013	\$ 840.89	\$ 840.89	
08-452-0042	\$ 172.91	No Bid	Struck Off to County
09-031-0032	\$ 188.60	\$ 188.60	
09-083-0059	\$ 7,421.31	\$ 9,000.00	
09-566-0011	\$ 405.81	\$ 600.00	
11-007-0005	\$ 7,016.61	\$ 40,000.00	
11-045-0003	\$ 412.99	No Bid	Struck Off to County
11-369-0028	\$ 177.90	\$ 177.90	
12-047-0005	\$ 8,139.34	\$ 45,000.00	
12-169-0004	\$ 166.97	\$ 166.97	
14-014-0010	\$ 3,229.15	\$ 6,000.00	
14-023-0006	\$ 1,915.65	No Bid	Struck Off to County
17-032-0017	\$ 11,788.80	\$ 77,000.00	
19-040-0011	\$ 200.18	\$ 200.18	
22-040-0023	\$ 6,653.44	\$ 18,000.00	
22-170-0006	\$ 21,290.22	\$ 31,000.00	
23-013-0144	\$ 582.51	\$ 10,000.00	
23-024-0011	\$ 2,548.50	\$ 12,000.00	
23-034-0028	\$ 1,768.38	\$ 8,500.00	

**2012 TAX SALE**

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-006-0035	\$ 351.81	\$ 400.00	
01-011-0006	\$ 935.27	\$ 935.27	
01-014-0024	\$ 2,651.57	\$ 2,651.57	
01-025-0018	\$ 2,531.04	\$ 2,531.04	
01-035-0027	\$ 701.62	\$ 701.62	
01-065-0046	\$ 6,543.72	\$ 14,500.00	Sale Not Ratified
02-021-0040	\$ 5,881.68	\$ 43,000.00	
02-027-0037	\$ 1,002.03	\$ 4,750.00	

02-037-0062	\$	2,651.75	\$	2,651.75	
03-007-0004 \	\$	1,233.70			
03-007-0005 /	\$	15,341.93	\$	17,000.00	
03-029-0024	\$	5,852.47	\$	16,500.00	Sale Not Ratified
04-026-0021	\$	4,770.25	\$	27,000.00	
04-051-0002	\$	1,070.20	\$	5,250.00	
05-119-0016	\$	5,502.72	\$	-	Struck Off to County
07-097-0004	\$	800.57	\$	3,000.00	
13-188-0055	\$	1,487.49	\$	-	Struck Off to County
14-006-0041	\$	1,109.62	\$	1,109.62	
16-044-0023	\$	32,128.41	\$	32,250.00	
16-049-0022	\$	12,482.20	\$	-	Struck Off to County
17-032-0017	\$	9,112.40	\$	92,500.00	Sale Not Ratified
23-024-0003	\$	2,462.58	\$	10,000.00	
23-024-0016	\$	1,194.65	\$	8,500.00	
23-026-0005	\$	1,787.51	\$	7,000.00	
23-026-0006	\$	1,862.06	\$	9,000.00	

### 2011 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
02-032-0063	\$ 168.84	\$ 168.84	
02-053-0060	\$ 270.40	\$ -	Struck Off to County
02-054-0011	\$ 18,376.63	\$ 18,376.63	
02-054-0023	\$ 220.42	\$ 220.42	
04-012-0035	\$ 3,340.44	\$ 5,500.00	
04-020-0058	\$ 189.30	\$ 189.30	
04-059-0025	\$ 5,244.21	\$ 7,500.00	
04-065-0087	\$ 252.78	\$ 500.00	
05-049-0015	\$ 189.30	\$ 450.00	
07-085-0026	\$ 698.34	\$ 698.34	
09-550-0012	\$ 4,148.28	\$ 18,000.00	
11-044-0030	\$ 331.94	\$ 331.94	
12-052-0052	\$ 6,152.77	\$ 24,000.00	
12-057-0028	\$ 164.79	\$ 164.79	
12-120-0028	\$ 395.32	\$ 395.32	
14-043-0016	\$ 3,298.65	\$ 7,500.00	
14-043-0027	\$ 2,803.46	\$ 2,803.46	
15-076-0006	\$ 2,173.94	\$ 4,500.00	
15-406-0001	\$ 3,773.39	\$ 9,000.00	
17-084-0017	\$ 267.93	\$ 267.93	
18-054-0024	\$ 180.23	\$ 180.23	
19-075-0015	\$ 601.64	\$ 2,000.00	
21-071-0005	\$ 158.27	\$ 158.27	
23-031-0015	\$ 1,767.69	\$ 11,000.00	
23-035-0025	\$ 2,663.57	\$ 12,000.00	
23-036-0004	\$ 3,159.88	\$ 9,500.00	
23-037-0013	\$ 1,819.45	\$ 12,000.00	

### 2010 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-045-0037	\$ 3,332.45	\$ 6,100.00	
02-038-0050	\$ 374.05	\$ 374.05	
02-060-0002	\$ 164.52	\$ 164.52	
03-007-0036	\$ 1,774.49	\$ 6,000.00	
04-031-0003	\$ 5,545.82	\$ 9,000.00	
04-044-0018	\$ 953.82	\$ -	Struck Off to County
04-045-0020	\$ 180.57	\$ 180.57	
06-014-0020	\$ 854.89	\$ 3,500.00	
06-065-0039	\$ 157.32	\$ -	Struck Off to County
07-192-0008	\$ 834.44	\$ 834.44	
13-125-0037	\$ 152.91	\$ -	Struck Off to County
14-031-0054	\$ 852.54	\$ 852.54	
15-029-0126	\$ 260.32	\$ 260.32	
15-113-0002	\$ 192.89	\$ -	Struck Off to County
18-063-0027	\$ 137.82	\$ 137.82	
20-010-0007	\$ 360.36	\$ 360.36	

### 2009 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-048-0031	\$ 3,800.99	\$ 34,000.00	
02-042-0034	\$ 338.88	\$ 338.88	
03-023-0023	\$ 166.53	\$ -	Struck Off to County
04-032-0015	\$ 169.10	\$ 169.10	
04-040-0062	\$ 368.76	\$ -	Struck Off to County
04-042-0059	\$ 623.79	\$ 1,000.00	
05-080-0004	\$ 597.02	\$ 600.00	
07-004-0004	\$ 230.85	\$ -	Struck Off to County
08-383-0017	\$ 220.53	\$ 220.53	
10-046-0004	\$ 246.88	\$ 17,000.00	
11-090-0010	\$ 153.65	\$ -	Struck Off to County
11-112-0041	\$ 845.31	\$ -	Struck Off to County
12-128-0024	\$ 4,270.87	\$ 13,000.00	
13-043-0064	\$ 5,358.77	\$ 40,000.00	
17-062-0100	\$ 280.11	\$ 280.11	
19-141-0001	\$ 939.33	\$ 2,200.00	
21-010-0001	\$ 169.53	\$ 5,000.00	
22-045-0022	\$ 282.29	\$ 282.29	

### 2008 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-014-0051	\$ 220.89	\$ 220.89	
01-051-0055	\$ 394.87	\$ 394.87	
01-063-0017	\$ 618.67	\$ 2,700.00	
02-011-0067	\$ 252.82	\$ 400.00	
02-061-0006	\$ 204.40	\$ 204.40	
03-007-0041	\$ 6,345.03	\$ 22,000.00	

05-080-0006	\$	772.99	\$	-	Struck Off to County
05-139-0062	\$	634.66	\$	1,200.00	
07-226-0010	\$	4,078.51	\$	16,000.00	
08-052-0010	\$	2,998.21	\$	2,998.21	
12-073-0015 \	\$	385.26	\$	1,100.00	Sale Not Ratified
12-073-0016 /					
14-025-0002 \	\$	2,180.02	\$	9,500.00	
14-025-0005 /					
14-044-0012	\$	3,163.53	\$	14,000.00	
19-024-0051	\$	304.03	\$	2,200.00	
19-040-0011	\$	336.50	\$	336.50	
23-025-0015	\$	771.01	\$	24,000.00	

### 2007 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-006-0035	\$ 167.39	\$ 167.39	
01-011-0006	\$ 1,240.28	\$ 26,000.00	
01-025-0017	\$ 152.55	\$ 152.55	
01-034-0016	\$ 3,318.90	\$ 85,000.00	
02-037-0062	\$ 3,934.32	\$ 21,000.00	
02-052-0040	\$ 363.64	\$ 1,600.00	
05-118-0057	\$ 204.41	\$ -	Struck Off to County
06-032-0041	\$ 196.99	\$ 196.99	
09-087-0023	\$ 413.33	\$ 1,100.00	
11-016-0048	\$ 271.84	\$ 271.84	
11-089-0005	\$ 545.24	\$ 2,100.00	
11-089-0006	\$ 448.00	\$ 5,500.00	
11-177-0014	\$ 195.52	\$ 195.52	
12-030-0062	\$ 167.39	\$ 167.39	
12-109-0026	\$ 178.53	\$ 5,500.00	
14-022-0001	\$ 2,522.84	\$ 16,000.00	
14-027-0020	\$ 4,193.82	\$ 7,500.00	
19-141-0015	\$ 187.14	\$ 900.00	

### 2006 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid
01-014-0024	\$ 1,820.79	\$ 5,700.00
03-018-0025	\$ 2,236.95	\$ 11,500.00
07-104-0002	\$ 1,059.21	\$ 3,600.00
09-074-0010	\$ 2,037.74	\$ 4,500.00
11-085-0032	\$ 1,728.85	\$ 5,000.00
11-090-0009	\$ 4,612.04	\$ 18,500.00
11-090-0011	\$ 1,531.47	\$ 10,500.00
13-056-0022	\$ 1,260.18	\$ 2,000.00
13-056-0027	\$ 3,785.61	\$ 10,500.00
18-036-0016	\$ 93.24	\$ 93.24
23-035-0015	\$ 957.12	\$ 21,000.00

### 2005 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
04-012-0002	\$ 3,606.36	\$ 3,606.36	
04-020-0046	\$ 182.15	\$ 500.00	
05-108-0039	\$ 1,841.56	\$ -	Struck Off to County
05-109-0012	\$ 3,940.97	\$ 9,500.00	
05-114-0015	\$ 9,059.57	\$ 9,059.57	
06-039-0013	\$ 355.52	\$ 500.00	
09-074-0036	\$ 363.69	\$ -	Struck Off to County
11-044-0025	\$ 1,802.76	\$ -	Struck Off to County
12-030-0063	\$ 389.73	\$ 389.73	
12-030-0065	\$ 359.70	\$ 359.70	
12-090-0038	\$ 397.89	\$ 397.89	
14-003-0024	\$ 169.34	\$ 169.34	
14-023-0006	\$ 1,189.53	\$ 1,300.00	
15-201-0015	\$ 943.76	\$ -	Struck Off to County
16-117-0015	\$ 98.00	\$ 700.00	
19-002-0026	\$ 2,186.73	\$ 2,400.00	
19-036-0009	\$ 963.94	\$ 963.94	
23-024-0006	\$ 1,097.45	\$ 4,500.00	
23-024-0009	\$ 1,102.07	\$ 5,300.00	
23-024-0010	\$ 1,249.78	\$ 6,300.00	
23-024-0011	\$ 1,552.03	\$ 7,600.00	

### 2004 TAX SALE

Parcel Number	Opening Bid	Ending Bid	
01-014-0020	\$ 274.63	\$ 274.63	
01-047-0006	\$ 170.74	\$ 275.00	
02-038-0050	\$ 306.72	\$ 306.72	
03-019-0034	\$ 122.55	\$ 122.55	
04-028-0043	\$ 189.46	\$ -	Struck Off to County
04-032-0015	\$ 202.92	\$ 202.92	
04-051-0004	\$ 3,632.05	\$ 5,000.00	
04-058-0008	\$ 1,776.45	\$ 1,776.45	
04-059-0060	\$ 277.88	\$ 277.88	
04-065-0014	\$ 165.57	\$ 165.57	
04-065-0088	\$ 249.53	\$ 249.53	
05-108-0039	\$ 1,578.95	\$ 1,950.00	
05-112-0051	\$ 277.17	\$ 18,000.00	
07-091-0013	\$ 159.39	\$ 159.39	
07-205-0013	\$ 1,281.74	\$ 1,500.00	
11-017-0004	\$ 371.02	\$ 4,500.00	
11-080-0062	\$ 153.00	\$ 153.00	
11-090-0010	\$ 166.07	\$ 166.07	
11-112-0041	\$ 1,057.27	\$ 1,057.27	
12-100-0025	\$ 517.53	\$ 517.53	
14-017-0007	\$ 165.38	\$ -	Struck Off to County
14-038-0031	\$ 164.06	\$ 164.06	

14-046-0022	\$	371.72	\$	371.72
14-046-0025	\$	1,414.81	\$	1,414.81
14-046-0026	\$	638.93	\$	638.93
14-046-0027	\$	347.61	\$	347.61
14-046-0036	\$	200.38	\$	200.38
14-046-0037	\$	168.26	\$	168.26
15-005-0028	\$	62.35	\$	62.35
16-197-0007	\$	354.59	\$	354.59
17-105-0001	\$	215.50	\$	215.50
19-001-0007	\$	1,906.20	\$	1,906.20
19-025-0024	\$	201.13	\$	201.13
19-025-0026	\$	168.29	\$	168.29
20-029-0017	\$	316.33	\$	11,500.00
23-039-0004	\$	837.73	\$	17,000.00
05-112-0028	\$	3,629.71	\$	34,000.00
09-037-0003	\$	4,938.56	\$	- Sale Not Ratified